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The November full moon, also known as the Beaver Moon, is an important time for Wiccans and 
other practitioners of witchcraft. It is a time when the veil between the worlds is thin, and magic is 
believed to be especially potent. In this article, we will explore the significance of the November 
full moon from a Wiccan perspective and discuss some of the rituals and practices associated with 
this lunar phase.

The Beaver Moon gets its name from the fact that this is the time of year when beavers are 
preparing for winter by building their dams and lodges. In Wiccan tradition, the beaver is associated
with hard work, perseverance, and building a strong foundation. This makes the November full 
moon an ideal time for setting intentions and working on long-term goals.

One of the most popular rituals associated with the November full moon is the creation of a 
manifestation list. This involves writing down all of the things that you wish to manifest in your 
life, whether they are physical possessions, personal qualities, or career aspirations. It is important 
to be specific and clear about what you want, as this will help to focus your energy and increase the 
likelihood of success.

Once you have created your manifestation list, you can perform a ritual to charge it with energy. 
This can involve lighting candles, burning incense, and using crystals or other magical tools to 
amplify your intentions. Some Wiccans also like to recite affirmations or prayers to help align their 
energy with their goals.

Another common practice during the November full moon is divination. This is the art of seeking 
knowledge or guidance from a higher power or the universe itself. Wiccans often use tools such as 
tarot cards, runes, or pendulums to facilitate their divination practice. This is an ideal time to seek 
guidance on any issues or challenges that you may be facing in your life.

In addition to manifestation and divination, the November full moon is also a time for honoring 
ancestors and departed loved ones. In many cultures, this is a time when the veil between the living 
and the dead is thinnest, and it is believed that the spirits of the departed can more easily 
communicate with the living. Wiccans may set up an ancestor altar or perform a ritual to honor their
ancestors and invite their guidance and wisdom.

Finally, the November full moon is also a time for letting go of the past and releasing negative 
energy. This can involve performing a banishing ritual, where you symbolically release any 
negative patterns, habits, or beliefs that are holding you back. It is important to focus on the positive
aspects of your life and to release any attachments or fears that may be preventing you from 
achieving your goals.

In conclusion, the November full moon is a powerful time for Wiccans and other practitioners of 
witchcraft. It is a time for manifestation, divination, honoring ancestors, and releasing negative 
energy. By setting intentions and working with the energy of the moon, Wiccans can tap into their 
inner power and create positive changes in their lives. Whether you are a seasoned practitioner or 
just beginning your journey, the November full moon is a time for growth, transformation, and 
magic.

----------

For this November full moon ritual, you will need the following items:

• A piece of paper and a pen
• A small bowl of water



• A handful of dried herbs or flowers (such as lavender, rose petals, or sage)
• A candle (preferably in a color associated with the November full moon, such as silver or 

gray)
• An object that represents your ancestors or departed loved ones (such as a photo or a piece 

of jewelry)

Before performing any ritual, it is important to take some time to ground and center yourself. You 
can do this by finding a quiet place to sit or lie down, taking a few deep breaths, and focusing your 
attention on your body and your breath. You may also want to light some candles or burn some 
incense to create a sacred space for your ritual.

Step 1: Begin by lighting your candle and placing it in front of you. Take a few deep breaths and 
focus your attention on the flame, allowing yourself to become fully present in the moment.

Step 2: Take the piece of paper and pen, and write down all of the things that you wish to manifest 
in your life. Be specific and clear about what you want, and focus on positive, empowering 
statements. Once you have finished, fold the paper and place it in front of the candle.

Step 3: Take the bowl of water and sprinkle some of the herbs or flowers into it. This will create a 
cleansing and purifying energy. Dip your fingers into the water and sprinkle it around the room, 
visualizing the negative energy being washed away and replaced with positive, uplifting energy.

Step 4: Hold the object that represents your ancestors or departed loved ones and take a few 
moments to connect with their energy. Visualize them surrounding you with love and support, and 
ask for their guidance and wisdom.

Step 5: Take the folded piece of paper and hold it over the candle flame. As the paper burns, 
visualize your intentions being released into the universe and manifesting in your life. Once the 
paper has burned completely, place the ashes in the bowl of water.

Step 6: Take a few moments to meditate and reflect on the energy of the November full moon. 
Visualize the energy of the moon flowing into you, filling you with strength, clarity, and inspiration.

Step 7: When you feel ready, close the ritual by thanking your ancestors, the elements, and any 
other spirits or energies that you have called upon. Blow out the candle and dispose of the bowl of 
water and ashes.

Remember, this is just one example of a full moon ritual, and you can always adapt it to suit your 
own needs and preferences. The most important thing is to approach the ritual with an open heart 
and a clear intention, and to allow the energy of the moon to guide and support you on your path.


